
The Heart of an Armor-Bearer 
 
1 Samuel 14:1-7, 11-14 (ESV) 
One day Jonathan the son of Saul said to the young man who carried his armor, 
“Come, let us go over to the Philistine garrison on the other side.” But he did not 
tell his father. Saul was staying in the outskirts of Gibeah in the pomegranate cave 
at Migron. The people who were with him were about six hundred men, including 
Ahijah the son of Ahitub, Ichabod’s brother, son of Phinehas, son of Eli, the priest 
of the LORD in Shiloh, wearing an ephod. And the people did not know that 
Jonathan had gone. Within the passes, by which Jonathan sought to go over to the 
Philistine garrison, there was a rocky crag on the one side and a rocky crag on the 
other side. The name of the one was Bozez, and the name of the other Seneh. The 
one crag rose on the north in front of Michmash, and the other on the south in 
front of Geba. Jonathan said to the young man who carried his armor, “Come, let 
us go over to the garrison of these uncircumcised. It may be that the LORD will 
work for us, for nothing can hinder the LORD from saving by many or by few.” And 
his armor-bearer said to him, “Do all that is in your heart. Do as you wish. Behold, 
I am with you heart and soul.” …So both of them showed themselves to the 
garrison of the Philistines. And the Philistines said, “Look, Hebrews are coming out 
of the holes where they have hidden themselves.” And the men of the garrison 
hailed Jonathan and his armor-bearer and said, “Come up to us, and we will show 
you a thing.” And Jonathan said to his armor-bearer, “Come up after me, for the 
LORD has given them into the hand of Israel.” Then Jonathan climbed up on his 
hands and feet, and his armor-bearer after him. And they fell before Jonathan, 
and his armor-bearer killed them after him. And that first strike, which Jonathan 
and his armor-bearer made, killed about twenty men within as it were half a 
furrow’s length in an acre of land. 
 
What qualities are you looking for most in a friend, a partner, an employee, a 
spouse? 

• Agreement 
• Ability 
• Allegiance 

 
The best armor-bearer is the one who possesses all these qualities 
 



The primary responsibility of the armor-bearer is to carry the things that you are 
not able to carry on your own 
 
God is the Standard-Bearer of all Armor-Bearers 
 
God Knows How To Carry Us 
 
Exodus 19:4 (ESV) 
You yourselves have seen what I did to the Egyptians, and how I bore you on 
eagles’ wings and brought you to myself. 
 
Deuteronomy 1:31 (ESV) 
…and in the wilderness, where you have seen how the LORD your God carried 
you, as a man carries his son, all the way that you went until you came to this 
place. 
 
God Knows How To Carry Our Problems 
 
Psalm 55:22 (ESV) 
Cast your burden on the LORD, and he will sustain you; he will never permit the 
righteous to be moved. 
 
1 Peter 5:6-7 (ESV) 
Humble yourselves, therefore, under the mighty hand of God so that at the proper 
time he may exalt you, casting all your anxieties on him, because he cares for you. 
 
God Knows How To Carry Our Cross 
 
Isaiah 53:4-6 (ESV) 
Surely he has borne our griefs and carried our sorrows; yet we esteemed him 
stricken, smitten by God, and afflicted. But he was pierced for our transgressions; 
he was crushed for our iniquities; upon him was the chastisement that brought us 
peace, and with his wounds we are healed. All we like sheep have gone astray; we 
have turned – every one – to his own way; and the LORD has laid on him the 
iniquity of us all. 
 
God Knows How To Carry Everything We Need To Win 



 
Psalm 35:1-3 (ESV) 
Contend, O LORD, with those who contend with me; fight against those who fight 
against me! Take hold of shield and buckler and rise for my help! Draw the spear 
and javelin against my pursuers! Say to my soul, “I am your salvation!” 
 
Agreement – “I am with you” 
 
Acts 18:9-10 (ESV) 
And the Lord said to Paul one night in a vision, “Do not be afraid, but go on 
speaking and do not be silent, for I am with you, and no one will attack you to 
harm you, for I have many in this city who are my people.” 
 
Ability – “I will help you” 
 
Hebrews 13:6 (ESV) 
So we can confidently say, “The Lord is my helper; I will not fear; what can man do 
to me?” 
 
Allegiance – “I will not leave you” 
 
Joshua 1:5 (ESV) 
No man shall be able to stand before you all the days of your life. Just as I was 
with Moses, so I will be with you. I will not leave you or forsake you. 
 
Because Jesus Is Our Armor-Bearer, We Will Be His Fruit-Bearers 
 
John 15:4-9 (ESV) 
Abide in me, and I in you. As the branch cannot bear fruit by itself, unless it abides 
in the vine, neither can you, unless you abide in me. I am the vine; you are the 
branches. Whoever abides in me and I in him, he it is that bears much fruit, for 
apart from me you can do nothing. If anyone does not abide in me he is thrown 
away like a branch and withers; and the branches are gathered, thrown into the 
fire, and burned. If you abide in me, and my words abide in you, ask whatever you 
wish, and it will be done for you. By this my Father is glorified, that you bear much 
fruit and so prove to be my disciples. As the Father has loved me, so have I loved 
you. Abide in my love. 


